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The ICC ONE Toastmasters Club held its 450th milestone meeting on the 22nd of July 2024, Monday
evening, at Club House of Royal Gardens, Doha-Qatar. The club will be completing 21 years since
its chartering on the 30th October 2003. The 450th meeting of the Club was celebrated with music,
games and fun.

The Club President TM Madhusoodanan Nair called 450th meeting to order. He welcomed the
District officials, Founder Members and Guests. He then emphasized on the 21 years legacy of the
Club which has been preserved by the members and been upheld by the current group of
members.
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The meeting was inaugurated by M I Farid, DTM, Founder President along with members and
guests. The celebrations started with a Cake cutting. The Charter President MI Farid, DTM was
called upon to give an inauguration speech. He narrated the history of formation of the Club and
wished all the members to prosper on their Toastmasters’ journey. Past Presidents of the Club
were honoured in the meeting. District 116 Director Sabeena MK, DTM,  Past Region Advisor
Sonny Varghese, DTM, Past District Director Thayalan Kailyapillai, DTM, Past Division Governor
Ram Mohan Rai, DTM, Past Division Director, Philip Cherian, Current Division C Director Asokan
K and RSK Naidu, DTM delivered speeches on their Toastmasters ‘journey and wished ICC ONE
Toastmasters Club on the occasion.

Nalini GP Mathur, DTM was the Master of Ceremonies of the event.  Ajaya Rogiye, DTM along with
TM Suhaim Khan and TM Ashitosh conducted a comedy skit. TM Mubeen and RSK Naidu, DTM
treated the audience with Nostalgic Music. TM Hany Zamzam and TM Chandrasekhar Angadi
entertained the members and guest with humour.

The Executive Committee Mubeen Ali, Chandrasekhar Angadi, Lu Sin, Hany Zamzam, along with
the Immediate Past president Rejeesh P Rajan, Role players Riyas C, Rukhsana Idris and Muneer
Sheik played significant roles to make this event successful.



The event concluded with distributing gifts to guests and photo collage of current members to all
members along with a sumptuous Dinner.

 


